
1.

LOCATION, LOCATION, LOCATION

  Looking to save money on gas? With gas prices continuing to rise, why spend 
money fi lling up your tank and wasting time on a lengthy commute? With two 
convenient plant locations in Bullitt County, Publishers Printing Company is a 
practical solution. 

2.

  SET SCHEDULE & SHIFT PREMIUM

  We are continuing to grow and advance in our industry. Being on a set schedule 
with a stable company means you can budget your expenses more effectively. 
Additionally, employees who work 2nd and 3rd shift receive an additional 10% on 
their hourly pay. Although overtime is not guaranteed, if an employee is 
required to work overtime during the week, anything over 8 hours in a day is time 
and a half. Weekend overtime (anything over 40 hours) is time and a half and 
Sundays are double time.

3.

MOVIN’ ON UP
We take pride in our advancement opportunities at Publishers Printing Company. 
Advancement is based on performance, ability and future potential. With a variety 
of departments and positions there are many possibilities and career opportuni-
ties available.

4.

REASONS TO WORK AT PUBLISHERS PRINTING COMPANY

  SAFETY

  We encourage employees to participate in our Safety Incentive Program which 
allows employees the opportunity to win extra money throughout the year. 
Additionally, employees may also take advantage of several company sponsored 
training programs. Our Certifi ed EMTs, Fire Brigade, and Safety Committee 
receive bonuses for their services each January.

5.

TOP

BENEFITS

 Health, Dental, Vision, fl exible spending, Disability, Life Insurance, College Tuition 
Reimbursement, 401K, Vacation and Personal Days only name a few benefi ts we 
have to offer at Publishers.



	 	 Cutting Edge Technology and Training

		  Employees at Publishers are provided with on-the-job training for skill upgrades. 
After meeting specific guidelines, select employees are recognized by Master 
Printers of America as a craftsman/craftswoman in their trade.

6.

	 	 Tradition and Family Values

		  Publishers Printing Company is one of the few remaining family owned print-
ing companies serving the magazine industry. Brothers Nicholas X. Simon and 
Michael J. Simon represent the fifth generation of family ownership and continue 
today to provide the level of service and stability people have come to expect.

7.

	 	 We Care About Our Community 

		  At Publishers we take great pride in our quality of printing, customer service, and 
employees. We also care about giving back to our community. Publishers Printing 
Company and our dedicated employees donate time and money to many chari-
ties and local organizations to help make Bullitt County and surrounding areas a 
better place.

8.

		  Company Events
		  Several company-wide events take place each year. Free or discounted tickets 

are available to Churchill Downs, Derby Dinner Playhouse, Louisville Zoo, train 
rides, circus and much more. We also offer a Wellness Program and a monthly 
discount off membership at the YMCA.

9.

	 	 Meet New People

	 	 With over 1,400 employees between our two facilities, Publishers Printing Com-
pany is a great place to meet new people.

10.

TOP         REASONS TO WORK AT PUBLISHERS PRINTING CO.


